
Choice – free will and Free Will
I do not believe I chose to fall. I did choose to incarnate into an experience wherein 
falling is possible and affords one opportunities to grow and appreciate more in such 
experiences.

When one begins to remember that beyond the structure of finiteness where the 
Complete Spirit abides one isn’t “growing” through facing and overcoming challenge 
and adversity but gloriously expanding in experiences as Creation unfolds, that one 
might look around incarnation and say “I choose to be Free to delight in the 
infinitesimal ways Creation presents Itself.” Just as we have the right to choose to 
continue to experience the surprises of an incarnate life that includes the “good, the 
bad” and the sometimes very tough extremes, we have the right to choose, “Thank you, 
and I choose now to be Complete with that format of learning.”

This doesn’t mean you “die,” or that you have to give up things or people you love. It 
would mean that your choices are no longer subject. What one does with their newly 
reclaimed utter Free Will, how one chooses to actualize Consciousness, will be up to 
them. And THIS is why it is paramount for anyone choosing this route that they 
understand it cannot be accomplished if one still has the tendency, the urge, the 
“temptation” to want to fix people or things. Remember all the times Yo-El wanted to 
go into the Earth-Place to help, and Father and the Shining One made sure Yo-El 
understood that he could offer, but it had to be in a way that would not interfere in any 
way with their creations and their choices. He left finiteness numerous times, and those 
with him, to reckon with this.

The “ending” of that historical retelling by the Elders was that the “time” would come 
when those in the All would go back to the No-Place, the Shining One leading, and 
open the way for all in all realms to see the Portal to True Freedom for those within 
those realms who had long forgotten. When He comes, it will be up, then, for each to 
choose either to move through the Portal or continue on in finiteness because 
overcoming and success does indeed feel so wondrous.

This group is a vanguard. We have been blessed beyond measure with knowing the true 
history and future of humankind recounted from the Love beyond that sees it all, far 
more than Earthly historians could ever imagine. Through immersing ourselves in that 
work we came to our history from outside this life and incarnations. And we are 
choosing, with all our heart and with all our might and against all the odds we had 
previously agreed to, to go out and meet the Light at the Portal. When we have done 
that, each will be Free to choose what comes next for them and how they will exercise, 
actualize, their newly reclaimed, Utterly Exquisite Uniqueness. And they will Know in 



an instant, by Earthly measure. In that instant, will they be or have been “gone?” Only 
so as they would choose.

Our utter focus on the Light will surely have beautiful effects on mass-mind, but that 
cannot be our focus. See? But meeting the Light at the Portal, moving now to meet the 
Shining One and all our Brethren … Can you imagine the gift we will have given 
ourselves for all Eternity? And the blessing we shall have given to the Path and Its 
offering of Freedom for all?

Actualizing Consciousness Does Not Mean Death - Actualizing Consciousness means 
that the consciousness we have been accustomed to in this lifetime will be replaced by 
the full Consciousness we currently abide in as Spirit.

This does not mean “death” as someone inferred to me the other day. It would mean the 
greater LIFE, for one would be be able to express and experience life Freely, True Free 
Will claimed WITHIN FINITENESS. Beyond the free will of an adept who delights in 
life and in being able to make the highest and best out of every situation, this is the Free 
Will of a master who delights in Freely choosing every experience and in BEing the 
FREED LIGHT of their Uniqueness wherever they are guided to be.

About the Lavender Mist – Though no longer lavender unless I bring that on for the 
sheer sweetness of doing so, the Mist is a literal mist around me now that I see through. 
I know it to be Father, but additionally it is as though He said to me, “As you see me 
with you now, watch. I will play with you.” And it is that, because I do and because I 
also expect Him, He is there to greet me in all the little choices. In my conscious 
intentional awareness, for instance, as I raise a glass of water to drink, or wake up my 
computer, or reach for the door knob… He greets me, like, “See? I told you.” And so, He 
is everywhere and it is such a peaceful joy. I see through Him to the choices I make, so it 
makes finiteness surreal and the infinite the reality. The added bonus is that I am 
dwelling within the Consciousness of those who walk with me unseen. No, I don’t 
“see” them. I just feel and know them all about in the sweet Mist. It isn’t that finiteness 
has no joy or is of less value. It’s that it has this new spin on it. Can you imagine? If you 
can, we can play in the Mist together and tell one another about the wonders.


